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A fossilised jawbone found poking out of the ground in Ethiopia has set the story of human origins back 
nearly half a million years to a time when early man shared the vast grassland plains of eastern Africa with 
a rich variety of prehistoric animals. 

Scientists have confirmed that the jawbone belongs to the Homo genus and, at 1.8 million years old, is 
more than 400,000 years older than the oldest previous fossil of the same group of early humans who 
eventually gave rise to our own species, Homo sapiens. 

The discovery begins to fill in a huge gap in human origins between the primitive “ape man” of 
Australopithecus afarensis – best known from the Lucy fossil discovered in Ethiopia in 1974 – and the 
earliest known members of the “human” family, the species Homo habilis or “handy man”. “The jaw helps 
to narrow the evolutionary gap between Australopithecus and early Homo. It’s an excellent case of a 
transitional fossil in a critical time period in human evolution,” said Bill Kimbel, director of the Institute 
of Human Origins at Arizona State University in Tempe. 

The incomplete mandible with teeth was found by graduate student Chalachew Seyoum of the Authority 
for Research and Conservation of Cultural Heritage in Addis Ababa, who made the discovery while 
surveying a hill in the Ledi-Geraru area of the Afar region of Ethiopia, where many early human fossils 
have been unearthed. 

“After I had climbed up to the plateau, I saw a premolar coming out of the sediment and it attracted my 
eye,” Mr Seyoum said, explaining that the jawbone had already become partially exposed by the 
weathering of the surrounding rock. 

The fossil is the oldest 
known evidence of a creature descended from apes belonging to the genus Homo, the family of 



animals that includes people living today 
Although scientists are not yet sure which species the jawbone’s owner belongs to, they are confident it 
can be included in the “human” lineage of Homo, which is characterised by an upright, bipedal posture, 
sophisticated tool-making abilities and a relatively large braincase. 

“In spite of a lot of searching, fossils on the Homo lineage older than two million years ago are very rare. 
To have a glimpse of the very earliest phase of our lineage’s evolution is particularly exciting,” said Brian 
Villmoare of the University of Nevada and lead author of the study published in the journal Science. 

The previous oldest Homo specimen was an upper jawbone from Ethiopia dating to about 2.3 million 
years ago and was classified as the earliest known member of Homo habilis, a species thought to have 
given rise to the later Homo erectus, which then evolved into Homo sapiens. 

Homo habilis was first described by the paleoanthropologist Louis Leakey in 1964 who based the 
description on fossilised remains – a lower jawbone, parts of a braincase and hand bones – unearthed in 
Olduvai Gorge in Tanzania, dated to 1.8 million years old. 

However, a new study of this partial skull with CT X-rays, published in the journal Nature, has now 
revealed that its jawbone was in fact more primitive than the much older H. habilis specimen dating to 2.3 
million years ago. 
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This suggests there must have been an even older common ancestor of both H. habilis specimens, said 
Fred Spoor of University College London and the Max Planck Institute for Evolutionary Anthropology in 
Leipzig, who believes the answer now lies with the new jawbone discovery in Ethiopia. 

“We were in contact with the other group working in Ethiopia and they said they may have found what we 
are looking for in the shape of this specimen dating to 2.8 million years ago,” Dr Spoor told The 
Independent. 



“It’s certainly the case that this new lower jawbone is a good bridge between the primitive 
Australopithecus afarensis and Homo habilis. It’s on the human lineage, the lineage that leads to us,” Dr 
Spoor said. 

One of the unresolved questions is what environmental conditions led to the evolution of Homo. Some 
scientists have suggested that climate change and drought could have sparked the development of the 
human adaptations needed to survive on savannah grasslands populated by prehistoric antelope and 
elephants. 

“We can see the 2.9 million-year-old aridity signal in the Ledi-Geraru faunal community. But it’s still too 
soon to say that this means climate change is responsible for the origin of Homo,” said Kay Reede of 
Arizona State University. 

“We need a larger sample of hominid fossils and that’s why we continue to come to the Ledi-Geraru area 
to search,” Dr Reede said. 

 


