
News Release

WORLD OCEAN COUNCIL “SUSTAINABLE OCEAN 
SUMMIT” SET FOR 3-5 DECEMBER 2012

Ocean Industries to Meet in Washington, D.C. on Leadership in 
“Corporate Ocean Responsibility”

12 April 2012 –

The World Ocean Council’s second “Sustainable Ocean Summit” (SOS) will be 
held December 3-5 in Washington D.C. to further advance leadership and 
collaboration among the diverse ocean business community in addressing 
marine environment and sustainability challenges.

The SOS is the only international, cross-sectoral ocean sustainability 
conference designed by and for the private sector. The 2012 event builds on 
the highly successful SOS 2010, held in Belfast, Northern Ireland, which drew 
together more than 150 representatives from a wide range of ocean industries. 
Click here for a report of the SOS 2010.

“Companies and industry associations around the world are expressing strong 
interest in coordinated, international business leadership on cross-cutting 
ocean sustainability issues”, stated WOC Executive Director Paul Holthus. He 
further noted that many companies see the business value of collaboration that 
helps ensure continued access for responsible use of ocean space and 
resources.

The conference will address priorities for cross-sectoral industry leadership and 
collaboration in ocean sustainability, including: ocean policy, regulations and 
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governance; marine spatial planning; the role of industries in ocean and 
climate observations; biofouling, biosecurity and invasive species; fisheries and 
aquaculture interaction with other industries; cross-sectoral collaboration in 
responsible use of the Arctic; sound and marine life; port waste reception 
facilities and marine debris; marine mammal interactions; the role of finance, 
insurance and legal sectors in ocean sustainability. Other cross-cutting topics 
critical to responsible industry operations in the marine environment will be 
developed as the program evolves.

Limited opportunities are available for speakers to address the themes above. 
Experts interested in being considered as speakers are encouraged to contact 
the WOC.

About the World Ocean Council (WOC)

The WOC is the only international, cross-sectoral alliance for private sector 
leadership and collaboration in “Corporate Ocean Responsibility”. Companies 
and associations worldwide are distinguishing themselves as leaders in ocean 
sustainability and stewardship by joining the WOC. Members to date include 
over 40 leadership organizations from a wide range of ocean industries: 
renewable energy, oil and gas, shipping, seafood, tourism, ocean technology, 
maritime law, marine environmental services and other areas.

Contact: Paul Holthus +1 (808) 277-9008 paul.holthus@oceancouncil.org

Web: www.oceancouncil.org

To subscribe to future WOC News or to update your contact information, click 
here.

To share this issue of WOC News with others (on Facebook, Twitter, etc), click 
here.
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